
THERE ARE NO DEVIATIONS FROM APPLICABLE STANDARDS.

DEVIATIONS FROM STANDARDS

(REVISED APRIL 15, 2010)

1. IN THE EVENT THAT ANY UNFORESEEN CONDITIONS NOT COVERED BY THESE NOTES ARE ENCOUNTERED DURING GRADING
OPERATIONS, THE OWNER/ENGINEER SHALL BE IMMEDIATELY NOTIFIED FOR DIRECTION.

2. IT SHALL BE THE RESPONSIBILITY OF THE CONTRACTOR TO PERFORM ALL NECESSARY CUTS AND FILLS WITHIN THE LIMITS OF THIS
PROJECT AND THE RELATED OFF-SITE WORK, SO AS TO GENERATE THE DESIRED SUBGRADE, FINISH GRADES AND SLOPES SHOWN.

3. CONTRACTOR SHALL TAKE FULL RESPONSIBILITY FOR ALL EXCAVATION. ADEQUATE SHORING SHALL BE DESIGNED AND PROVIDED BY
THE CONTRACTOR TO PREVENT UNDERMINING OF ANY ADJACENT FEATURES OR FACILITIES AND/OR CAVING OF THE EXCAVATION.

4. THE CONTRACTOR IS WARNED THAT AN EARTHWORK BALANCE WAS NOT NECESSARILY THE INTENT OF THIS PROJECT. ANY
ADDITIONAL MATERIAL REQUIRED OR LEFTOVER MATERIAL FOLLOWING EARTHWORK OPERATIONS BECOMES THE RESPONSIBILITY OF
THE CONTRACTOR.

5. THE GRADING CONTRACTOR IS RESPONSIBLE TO COORDINATE WITH THE OWNER TO PROVIDE FOR THE REQUIREMENTS OF THE
PROJECT STORM WATER POLLUTION PREVENTION PLAN (SWPPP) AND ASSOCIATED PERMIT.

6. CONTRACTOR SHALL GRADE TO THE LINES AND ELEVATIONS SHOWN ON THE PLANS WITHIN THE FOLLOWING HORIZONTAL AND
VERTICAL TOLERANCES AND DEGREES OF COMPACTION, IN THE AREAS INDICATED:

 HORIZONTAL VERTICAL COMPACTION
A. PAVEMENT AREA SUBGRADE 0.1'+ +0.0' TO -0.1' SEE SOILS REPORT
B. ENGINEERED FILL 0.5'+ +0.1' TO -0.1' SEE SOILS REPORT

COMPACTION TESTING WILL BE PERFORMED BY THE OWNER OR HIS REPRESENTATIVE.

7. ALL CUT AND FILL SLOPES SHALL BE PROTECTED UNTIL EFFECTIVE EROSION CONTROL HAS BEEN ESTABLISHED.

8. THE USE OF POTABLE WATER WITHOUT A SPECIAL PERMIT FOR BUILDING OR CONSTRUCTION PURPOSES INCLUDING CONSOLIDATION
OF BACKFILL OR DUST CONTROL IS PROHIBITED. THE CONTRACTOR SHALL OBTAIN ALL NECESSARY PERMITS FOR CONSTRUCTION
WATER.

9. THE CONTRACTOR SHALL MAINTAIN THE STREETS, SIDEWALKS AND ALL OTHER PUBLIC RIGHT-OF-WAY IN A CLEAN, SAFE AND USABLE
CONDITION. ALL SPILLS OF SOIL, ROCK OR CONSTRUCTION DEBRIS SHALL BE PROMPTLY REMOVED FROM THE PUBLICLY OWNED
PROPERTY DURING CONSTRUCTION AND UPON COMPLETION OF THE PROJECT. ALL ADJACENT PROPERTY, PRIVATE OR PUBLIC SHALL
BE MAINTAINED IN A CLEAN, SAFE AND USABLE CONDITION.

10. IN THE EVENT THAT ANY TEMPORARY CONSTRUCTION ITEM IS REQUIRED THAT IS NOT SHOWN ON THESE DRAWINGS, THE OWNER
AGREES TO PROVIDE AND INSTALL SUCH ITEM AT HIS OWN EXPENSE AND AT THE DIRECTION OF THE CITY ENGINEER. TEMPORARY
CONSTRUCTION INCLUDES DITCHES, BERMS, ROAD SIGNS AND BARRICADES, ETC.

CITY OF LAS VEGAS SEWER NOTES

CITY OF LAS VEGAS GRADING NOTES

(REVISED SEPTEMBER 16,  2020)

1. ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE LATEST  EDITION OF THE DESIGN AND CONSTRUCTION
STANDARDS FOR WASTEWATER COLLECTION SYSTEMS AND THE UNIFORM STANDARD SPECIFICATIONS FOR PUBLIC WORKS'
CONSTRUCTION OFF-SITE IMPROVEMENTS, CLARK COUNTY AREA, NEVADA, AS AMENDED. IT WILL BE THE RESPONSIBILITY OF THE
CONTRACTOR TO BE AWARE OF THE CONTENTS OF  THE ABOVE SPECIFICATIONS.

2. IT SHALL BE THE CONTRACTOR'S RESPONSIBILITY TO PERFORM CONSTRUCTION AS PER PLANS. ANY ADDITIONS, DELETIONS, OR
CHANGES SHALL FIRST MEET WITH THE APPROVAL OF THE CITY ENGINEER.

3. CHISEL "S" OR "G" IN CURBS WHERE SEWER OR GAS LATERALS PASS UNDER THE CURB.

4. POLYVINYL (PVC) SEWER PIPE SHALL MEET ASTM D-3034 SDR 35 SPECIFICATIONS, INSTALLED WITH SAND BEDDING AND BACKFILL OF
TYPE II AGGREGATE BASE.

5. ALL MANHOLES PAVED IN STREETS EIGHTY (80') FOOT R/W AND LARGER SHALL HAVE CONCRETE COLLARS. STREETS LESS THAN
EIGHTY (80') FOOT R/W WILL REQUIRE RETROFIT IF PAVING DOES NOT CONFORM TO CITY  STANDARDS AT THE MANHOLE.

6. TEE SADDLES SHALL BE USED TO CONNECT SEWER LATERALS TO EXISTING MAIN LINES UP TO TWELVE INCH (12”) DIAMETER.
CONNECTIONS TO FIFTEEN INCH (15”) OR LARGER MAINS SHALL REQUIRE SPECIAL PROCEDURES. IN LINE “Y” 'S SHALL BE USED ON
LINES TWELVE INCHES (12”) OR ABOVE.

7. WATER MAINS SHALL BE PROTECTED IN ACCORDANCE WITH LVVWD STANDARDS WHENEVER A SEWER MAIN CROSSES OVER A
WATER MAIN OR THE SEWER IS LESS THAN EIGHTEEN INCH (18”) UNDER A WATER MAIN.

8. ALL CONTRACTORS INSTALLING SEWER MAINS THAT WILL BE UNDER THE JURISDICTION OF THE CITY OF LAS VEGAS MUST BE STATE
OF NEVADA CLASS “A” CONTRACTORS.

9. THE CITY OF LAS VEGAS WILL NOT ACCEPT ANY SEWER MAINS WHICH HAVE A VERTICAL DEFLECTION OF MORE THAN ONE TENTH
(0.1) OF A FOOT FROM THE APPROVED CONSTRUCTION PLANS AT ANY LOCATION. SEWER MAINS FOUND TO EXCEED THIS TOLERANCE
WILL HAVE TO BE REPAIRED OR REMOVED OR REPLACED TO THE SATISFACTION OF THE CITY ENGINEER PRIOR TO ACCEPTANCE BY
THE CITY OF LAS VEGAS.

10. INSTALLATION OF CURVED SEWER REQUIRES THE USE OF C-900 PIPE WHICH ALLOWS FOR PIPE DEFLECTION AT THE JOINTS.

11. SEWER SERVICES AS APPROVED ON THIS PLAN, ARE INTENDED SPECIFICALLY FOR THE LOT AND USE SHOWN, AND ARE NOT
INTENDED TO SERVE ADDITIONAL PARCELS OR STRUCTURES WHICH MAY BE CREATED IN THE FUTURE. IN THE EVENT THAT THE
PARCEL AND/OR LOTS SHOWN ON THIS PLAN ARE FURTHER DIVIDED TO CREATE ADDITIONAL PARCELS OR LOTS, THE OWNER IS
REQUIRE TO PROVIDE SEPARATE SEWER SERVICES TO EACH.

CITY OF LAS VEGAS GENERAL NOTES

CITY OF LAS VEGAS FIRE DEPARTMENT NOTES

APPROVALS:

CITY OF LAS VEGAS FIRE & RESCUE

CITY OF LAS VEGAS DEPARTMENT OF PLANNING

CITY OF LAS VEGAS ENGINEERING

FOR EXAMPLE ONLY - V
ERIFY CONTENT W

ITH APPROPRIATE AGENCIES(REVISED JANUARY 5, 2026)

1. ALL WORK SHALL BE DONE IN STRICT ACCORDANCE WITH THE LAS VEGAS FIRE AND RESCUE ADOPTED FIRE CODE ORDINANCE
# 6919 FOR HYDRANT SPECIFICATIONS AND HYDRANT INSTALLATION SPECIFICATIONS.

2. ONLY FIRE HYDRANTS THAT ARE ON THE LAS VEGAS VALLEY WATER DISTRICT’S APPROVED PRODUCTS LIST ARE ALLOWED TO
BE INSTALLED.
· ALL NEW PUBLIC FIRE HYDRANTS ARE TO BE SUPPLIED WITH HYDRANT LOCKS THAT ARE ON THE LAS VEGAS VALLEY

WATER DISTRICT’S APPROVED PRODUCTS LIST

3. A PERMIT IS REQUIRED FROM LAS VEGAS FIRE AND RESCUE FOR THE INSTALLATION OF ON-SITE WATER LINES AND FIRE
HYDRANTS. THE PERMIT AND CONTRACTORS' MATERIAL TEST CERTIFICATE FOR UNDERGROUND PIPING FORM SHALL BE
OBTAINED FROM THE FIRE PROTECTION ENGINEER BEFORE COMMENCEMENT OF WORK.  IFC § 105.6.19

4. ON ANY RESIDENTIAL OR COMMERCIAL INSTALLATIONS, FIRE HYDRANTS SHALL BE INSTALLED, AND FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS
ROADS SHALL BE MAINTAINED BEFORE COMMENCEMENT OF ANY COMBUSTIBLE CONSTRUCTION.  ALL FIRE HYDRANTS SHALL
BE IN GOOD WORKING ORDER AND SHALL BE CAPABLE OF DELIVERING THE REQUIRED FIRE FLOW.  IFC § 3307 (AS AMENDED)

5. TO IDENTIFY THE FIRE HYDRANT LOCATIONS, THE CONTRACTOR SHALL PLACE A BLUE REFLECTIVE MARKER AT THE CENTER
LINE OF THE STREET ADJACENT TO THE FIRE HYDRANTS. IFC § 507.5.7.3 (AS AMENDED)

6. ALL UNDERGROUND INSPECTIONS, PRESSURE, AND FLUSH VERIFICATIONS OF ALL FIRE HYDRANTS AND FIRE LINES SHALL BE
CONDUCTED BEFORE COVERING THE LINES.  CENTER LOADING IS ACCEPTABLE FOR THE HYDRO TESTS WITH PRIOR FIRE
PREVENTION APPROVAL.  IFC § 109

7. ALL ON-SITE UNDERGROUND WATER MAINS AND MATERIALS SHALL BE U.L. LISTED, A.W.W.A APPROVED AND SHALL BE RATED
FOR THE APPROPRIATE WORKING PRESSURE.  IFC § 507.2.1, NFPA 24

8. PAINTING OF CURBS, FIRE HYDRANTS, PADS, PROTECTION OF FIRE HYDRANTS FROM PHYSICAL DAMAGE, AND ALL OTHER
WORK NECESSARY PER PLANS SHALL BE COMPLETED BEFORE APPROVAL BY LAS VEGAS FIRE AND RESCUE, FIRE PREVENTION
DIVISION.  IFC § 507 (AS AMENDED)

9. PRIVATE HYDRANTS SHALL BE PAINTED RED.  IFC § 507.5.7.1 (AS AMENDED)

10. PRIOR TO THE FINAL OCCUPANCY, A FIRE FLOW TEST SHALL BE WITNESSED BY LAS VEGAS FIRE AND RESCUE, FIRE
PREVENTION DIVISION, TO VERIFY THE AVAILABILITY OF THE REQUIRED FIRE FLOW. IFC § 507

11. FIRE HYDRANT SPACING SHALL BE AS FOLLOWS:  IFC § C102 (AS AMENDED)
· RESIDENTIAL – 500 FT UNSPRINKLERED; 600 FT SPRINKLERED.
· COMMERCIAL – 300 FT UNSPRINKLERED; 400 FT (IF ALL BUILDINGS ON SITE ARE SPRINKLERED)

12. WHERE THE WATER MAINS ARE EXTENDED ALONG STREETS OR NEW STREETS ARE INSTALLED WHERE FIRE HYDRANTS ARE
NOT NEEDED FOR PROTECTION OF THE STRUCTURES, FIRE HYDRANTS SHALL BE INSTALLED AT A MAXIMUM OF 1000 FT
SPACING, TO PROVIDE FOR TRANSPORTATION HAZARDS. WHERE STREETS ARE PROVIDED WITH MEDIAN DIVIDERS OR HAVE
FOUR (4) OR MORE TRAFFIC LANES AND HAVE A TRAFFIC COUNT OF MORE THAN 30,000 PER DAY, HYDRANTS ARE REQUIRED ON
EACH SIDE OF THE STREET SPACED AT 500 FT ON AN ALTERNATING BASIS. ALL HYDRANTS BEING UTILIZED TO DELIVER FIRE
FLOW TO THE PROPOSED LOCATION SHALL BE LOCATED ON THE SAME SIDE OF THE STREET AS THE PROPOSED DEVELOPMENT.
IFC § C102.8 (AS AMENDED)

13. NO FIRE HYDRANTS SHALL BE LOCATED WITHIN THE RADIUS OF A CUL-DE-SAC OR WITHIN 20 FT OF THE PERIMETER OF THE
RADIUS OF THE CUL-DE-SAC.

14. NO FIRE HYDRANTS SHALL BE LOCATED WITHIN 6 FT OF ANY CURB RETURN, DRIVEWAY, POWER POLE, STREETLIGHT OR ANY
OTHER OBSTRUCTION.  IFC § C102.10 (AS AMENDED)

15. A MAXIMUM DISTANCE FROM A FIRE HYDRANT TO A ONE- OR TWO-FAMILY DWELLING SHALL NOT EXCEED 300 FT, AS MEASURED
BY AN APPROVED ROUTE.  IFC § C102.4 (AS AMENDED)

16. THE MAXIMUM DISTANCE FROM A FIRE HYDRANT TO A FIRE DEPARTMENT CONNECTION (FDC) SHALL NOT EXCEED 100 FT, AS
MEASURED BY AN APPROVED ROUTE. IFC § C102.7 (AS AMENDED)

17. THE MAXIMUM DISTANCE FROM A HYDRANT TO THE END OF A DEAD-END STREET SHALL NOT EXCEED 200 FT. IFC § C102.6 (AS
AMENDED)

18. TWO (2) SOURCES OF SUPPLY ARE REQUIRED WHENEVER THERE IS 4 OR MORE FIRE HYDRANTS/SPRINKLER LEAD-INS
INSTALLED ON A SINGLE SYSTEM. FOR SYSTEMS REQUIRED TO HAVE TWO (2) SOURCES OF WATER SUPPLY, SECTIONAL
CONTROL VALVES SHALL BE INSTALLED SO THAT NO MORE THAN 2 FIRE HYDRANTS AND/OR FIRE SPRINKLER LEAD-INS CAN BE
OUT OF SERVICE DUE TO A SERVICE INTERRUPTION. FOR SYSTEMS PERMITTED TO HAVE ONE SOURCE OF WATER SUPPLY,
SECTIONAL CONTROL VALVES SHALL BE INSTALLED SO THAT NO MORE THAN 3 FIRE HYDRANTS AND/OR FIRE SPRINKLER
LEAD-INS CAN BE OUT OF SERVICE DUE TO A SERVICE INTERRUPTION.  IFC § C104 (AS AMENDED)

19. ALL FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS SHALL BE PAVED TO PROVIDE ALL-WEATHER DRIVING CAPABILITIES AND SHALL BE
DESIGNED AND MAINTAINED TO SUPPORT THE IMPOSED LOADS OF THE FIRE APPARATUS.  IFC § 503.2.3

20. THE GRADIENT FOR THE FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS SHALL NOT EXCEED 12%. ANGLES OF APPROACH AND ANGLES OF
DEPARTURE SHALL NOT EXCEED 6% FOR 25 FT BEFORE OR AFTER THE GRADE CHANGE.  THE GRADIENT ADJACENT TO THE
STRUCTURES SHALL NOT EXCEED 6%.  IFC § 503.2.7 (AS AMENDED), § 503.2.8 (AS AMENDED)

21. THE TURNING RADIUS OF THE FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS SHALL BE NO LESS THAN 52 FT OUTSIDE AND 28 FT INSIDE
TURNING RADIUS.  IFC § 503.2.4 (AS AMENDED)

22. VERTICAL CLEARANCE OF ALL FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS SHALL NOT BE LESS THAN 13FT 6 INCHES.  IFC § 503.2.1

23. DIMENSIONS FOR ACCESS ROADS SERVING R-3 OCCUPANCIES. (IFC § 503.2.1.1 (AS AMENDED)) FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS
SERVING R-3 OCCUPANCIES, AS DEFINED BY THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE SECTION 310, PROVIDING RESIDENTIAL FIRE
SPRINKLER SYSTEMS, IN ACCORDANCE WITH CITY OF LAS VEGAS ORDINANCE 6919, THE UNOBSTRUCTED WIDTH OF FIRE
APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS SHALL BE AS FOLLOWS:
· NOT LESS THAN 33 FT. (10.05 M) WIDE, MEASURED FROM FACE OF CURB OR FLOW LINE TO FLOW LINE, WHERE PARKING IS

PERMITTED ON BOTH SIDES OF FIRE APPARATUS ROAD.
· NOT LESS THAN 28 FT. (8.34 M) WIDE, MEASURED FROM FACE OF CURB OR FLOW LINE TO FLOW LINE, WHERE PARKING IS

PERMITTED ON ONLY ONE SIDE OF THE FIRE APPARATUS ROAD
· NOT LESS THAN 24 FT. (7.32 M) WIDE, MEASURED FROM FACE OF CURB OR FLOW LINE TO FLOW LINE, WHERE NO PARKING IS

PERMITTED ON EITHER SIDE.

DIMENSIONS FOR ACCESS ROADS SERVING OCCUPANCIES OTHER THAN R-3 OCCUPANCIES. (IFC § 503.2.1.2 (AS AMENDED))
· FOR ALL OTHER OCCUPANCY TYPES AS DEFINED BY THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE SECTION 310, THE

UNOBSTRUCTED WIDTH OF FIRE ACCESS ROADS SHALL BE AS FOLLOWS:
· NOT LESS THAN 36 FT. (12.19 M) WIDE, MEASURED FROM FACE OF CURB OR FLOW LINE TO FLOW LINE, WHERE PARKING IS

PERMITTED ON BOTH SIDES OF FIRE APPARATUS ROAD.
· NOT LESS THAN 32 FT. (9.75 M) WIDE, MEASURED FROM FACE OF CURB OR FLOW LINE TO FLOW LINE, WHERE PARKING IS

PERMITTED ON ONLY ONE SIDE OF THE FIRE APPARATUS ROAD.
· NOT LESS THAN 24 FT. (7.32 M) WIDE, MEASURED FROM FACE OF CURB OR FLOW LINE TO FLOW LINE, WHERE NO PARKING IS

PERMITTED ON EITHER SIDE.
· NOT LESS THAN 24 FT. (7.32 M), FOR DESIGNATED FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS THROUGH PARKING LOTS.

24. A FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROAD SHALL BE REQUIRED WHEN ANY PORTION OF AN EXTERIOR WALL OF THE FIRST STORY IS
LOCATED MORE THAN 150 FT FROM A FIRE DEPARTMENT VEHICLE ACCESS. IFC § 503.1.1

25. APPROVED SECONDARY FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS SHALL BE PROVIDED FOR 200 OR MORE DWELLING UNITS, ROAD(S) WITH
DEAD-ENDS OR A SINGLE POINT OF ACCESS IN EXCESS OF 600 FT.  (IFC § 503.1.2.1 (AS AMENDED))

26. ALL DEAD-END FIRE APPARATUS ROADS AND/OR FIRE LANES, PUBLIC OR PRIVATE, IN EXCESS OF 150 FT IN LENGTH SHALL BE
PROVIDED WITH AN APPROVED TURNAROUND. (IFC § 503.2.5 (AS AMENDED))

27. DIMENSIONS FOR AERIAL FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS. (IFC § 503.2.10 (AS AMENDED))
ONE OR MORE OF THE REQUIRED ACCESS ROUTES MEETING THIS CONDITION SHALL BE LOCATED NOT LESS THAN 15 FEET (4.57
M) AND NOT GREATER THAN 30 FEET (9.14 M) FROM THE BUILDING AND SHALL BE POSITIONED PARALLEL TO ONE ENTIRE SIDE
OF THE BUILDING. THE SIDE OF THE BUILDING ON WHICH THE AERIAL FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROAD IS PLACED SHALL BE
APPROVED BY THE FIRE CODE OFFICIAL.
· NOT LESS THAN 26 FT. (7.93 M) WIDE, MINIMUM UNOBSTRUCTED WIDTH EXCLUSIVE OF SHOULDERS.
· OVERHEAD UTILITY, POWER LINES, TREES, CARPORTS, AND CANOPIES SHALL NOT BE LOCATED OVER THE AERIAL FIRE

APPARATUS ACCESS ROAD OR BETWEEN THE AERIAL FIRE APPARATUS ROAD AND THE BUILDING.

28. ALL FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS SHALL BE MARKED WHERE REQUIRED PER IFC § 503.3 (AS AMENDED)

29. ELECTRICALLY CONTROLLED ACCESS GATES SHALL BE PROVIDED WITH AN APPROVED EMERGENCY VEHICLE
DETECTOR/RECEIVER SYSTEM.  IFC § 503.6 (AS AMENDED)

(REVISED JANUARY 2026)

1. ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE “UNIFORM STANDARD SPECIFICATIONS FOR PUBLIC
WORKS CONSTRUCTION OFF-SITE IMPROVEMENTS, CLARK COUNTY AREA NEVADA”, LATEST ISSUE; THE “UNIFORM STANDARD
DRAWINGS FOR PUBLIC WORKS CONSTRUCTION, CLARK COUNTY AREA NEVADA”, LATEST REVISED EDITION; THE “SUMMERLIN
IMPROVEMENT STANDARDS” FOR WORK IN THE SUMMERLIN AREA; AND OTHER APPLICABLE APPROVED STANDARDS ISSUED BY THE
CONTROLLING AGENCY; THE UNIFORM BUILDING CODE; AND ALL LOCAL CITY CODES AND ORDINANCES APPLICABLE, EXCEPT AS
NOTED ON THIS SHEET AS “DEVIATIONS FROM STANDARDS”.

2. THE EXISTENCE AND LOCATION OF ANY OVERHEAD OR UNDERGROUND UTILITY LINES, PIPES, OR STRUCTURES SHOWN ON THESE
PLANS ARE OBTAINED BY A RESEARCH OF THE AVAILABLE RECORDS. EXISTING UTILITIES AS SHOWN FROM CLV PLANS LIBRARY
ARE APPROXIMATE AND FOR RECORD PURPOSES. EXISTING UTILITIES ARE LOCATED ON PLANS ONLY FOR THE CONVENIENCE OF
THE CONTRACTOR. EXISTING UTILITY SERVICE LATERALS MAY NOT BE SHOWN ON THE PLANS. THE CONTRACTOR SHALL, AT HIS
OWN EXPENSE, LOCATE ALL UNDERGROUND AND OVERHEAD INTERFERENCE’S WHICH MAY AFFECT HIS OPERATION DURING
CONSTRUCTION AND SHALL TAKE ALL NECESSARY PRECAUTIONS TO AVOID DAMAGE TO SAME. THE CONTRACTOR SHALL USE
EXTREME CAUTION WHEN WORKING NEAR OVERHEAD UTILITIES SO AS TO SAFELY PROTECT ALL PERSONNEL AND EQUIPMENT,
AND SHALL BE RESPONSIBLE FOR ALL COST AND LIABILITY IN CONNECTION THEREWITH.

3. THE CONTRACTOR SHALL TAKE ALL PRECAUTIONARY MEASURES NECESSARY TO PROTECT EXISTING UTILITY LINES, STRUCTURES
AND STREET IMPROVEMENTS WHICH ARE TO REMAIN IN PLACE, FROM DAMAGE, AND ALL SUCH IMPROVEMENTS OR STRUCTURES
DAMAGED BY THE CONTRACTOR’S OPERATIONS SHALL BE REPAIRED OR REPLACED SATISFACTORY TO THE CITY ENGINEER AND
OWNING UTILITY COMPANY AT THE EXPENSE OF THE CONTRACTOR.

4. ALL CONSTRUCTION SHALL BE AS SHOWN ON THESE PLANS, ANY REVISIONS SHALL HAVE THE PRIOR WRITTEN APPROVAL OF THE
CITY ENGINEER.

5. TYPE V CEMENT SHALL BE USED IN ALL OFF-SITE CONCRETE WORK. CONCRETE TO BE 3000 P.S.I. MINIMUM @ 28 DAYS. MIX DESIGNS
TO BE APPROVED BY THE CITY, PRIOR TO THE USE ON THE PROJECT.

6. PERMITS ARE REQUIRED FOR ANY WORK IN THE PUBLIC RIGHT-OF-WAY. THE CONTRACTOR SHALL SECURE ALL PERMITS AND
INSPECTIONS REQUIRED FOR THIS CONSTRUCTION.

7. EXPANSION JOINTS REQUIRED, MAXIMUM EVERY 300’ IN EXTRUDED-TYPE CURB.

8. AC PAVEMENT TO BE ONE-HALF INCH (½”) ABOVE LIP OF ALL GUTTERS AFTER COMPACTION, EXCEPT AT SIDEWALK RAMPS AND
CROSS GUTTERS.

9. CURB AND GUTTER FOUND TO BE UNACCEPTABLE TO THE CITY OF LAS VEGAS SHALL BE REMOVED AND REPLACED PER STANDARD
DRAWING 216.

10. SIDEWALK RAMPS SHALL BE CONSTRUCTED IN EACH QUADRANT OF AN INTERSECTION PER STANDARD DRAWING 235. EXACT
LOCATION OF RAMPS MAY BE ADJUSTED IN THE FIELD BY A CITY INSPECTOR.

11. CONTRACTOR SHALL PROVIDE ALL NECESSARY HORIZONTAL AND VERTICAL TRANSITIONS BETWEEN NEW CONSTRUCTION AND
EXISTING SURFACES TO PROVIDE FOR PROPER DRAINAGE AND FOR INGRESS AND EGRESS TO NEW CONSTRUCTION. THE EXTENT
OF THE TRANSITIONS TO BE AS SHOWN ON PLANS.

12. ALL GRADING WORK SHALL CONFORM TO THE SOILS REPORT AS PREPARED BY THE (COMPANY, REPORT #, DATE) APPROVED BY
THE CITY ENGINEER, AND AS SHOWN ON THESE PLANS.

13. EXACT LOCATION OF ALL SAWCUT LINES MAY BE ADJUSTED OR DETERMINED IN THE FIELD BY A CITY OF LAS VEGAS INSPECTOR IF
LOCATION ON PLANS IS NOT CLEARLY SHOWN, OR EXISTING PAVEMENT CONDITION REQUIRES RELOCATIONS.

14. THE CONTRACTOR SHALL TAKE ALL PRECAUTIONS NECESSARY TO PROTECT EXISTING PERMANENT SURVEY MONUMENTS. ANY
MONUMENTS DISTURBED SHALL BE REPLACED AND ADJUSTED PER AVAILABLE RECORDS IN ACCORDANCE WITH STATUTE NO.
625.380 & CITY OF LAS VEGAS TITLE 18, APPENDIX D.

15. UTILITY COMPANY METER BOXES, MANHOLE LIDS, VALVE COVERS, ETC., SHALL BE LOCATED OUT OF DRIVEWAYS, DRIVEWAY
APRONS, FLOWLINES, AND CROSS GUTTERS UNLESS WRITTEN APPROVAL IS GRANTED BY THE UTILITY COMPANY AND THE CITY
ENGINEER.

16. WALL NOTES: ALL WALLS, NEW OR EXISTING, ARE ONLY SHOWN ON CIVIL PLANS FOR THE PURPOSE OF REVIEWING GRADING
RELATIONSHIPS; FLOOD CONTROL AND SIGHT DISTANCE AT INTERSECTIONS. NEW WALLS REQUIRE A SEPARATE PERMIT AND
INSPECTION BY THE BUILDING DEPARTMENT.

17. ASPHALT MIX DESIGN MUST BE SUBMITTED AND APPROVED BY THE CITY ENGINEER PRIOR TO THE PLACEMENT OF ASPHALT WITHIN
CITY RIGHT OF WAY.

18. CONTRACTOR SHALL ADJUST ALL NEW AND EXISTING INLETS, VALVE BOXES, MANHOLE RIMS, AND SEWER CLEAN OUTS, ETC. TO
FINISH GRADE AS APPLICABLE WHETHER OR NOT THEY ARE SHOWN ON THE PLANS.

19. MATERIALS, HANDLING AND PLACEMENT OF PORTLAND CEMENT CONCRETE SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH APPLICABLE
SECTIONS OF NDOT OR THE CLARK COUNTY AREA SPECIFICATIONS (AS APPLICABLE) AND THE PLANS AND DETAILS SHOWN
HEREON.

20. WHEN INSTALLING UNDERGROUND FACILITIES THAT REQUIRE UNDERGROUND LOCATING DEVICES SUCH AS MARKER BALLS,
LOCATING RIBBON, ETC, THE CONTRACTOR SHALL PROVIDE WRITTEN DOCUMENTATION TO OFFSITE INSPECTION AND TESTING
CERTIFYING THAT ALL DEVICES HAVE BEEN PLACED AND VERIFIED TO BE IN GOOD WORKING CONDITION PRIOR TO THE
CONSTRUCTION OF ANY ROAD BASE.

21. AFTER HAUNCHING AND PRIOR TO BACKFILL OPERATIONS WHICH WOULD COVER SANITARY SEWER AND STORM DRAIN FACILITIES,
CONTRACTOR IS REQUIRED TO SCHEDULE CLV OPEN-TRENCH UTILITY SURVEY INSPECTION FOR DETERMINATION OF FINAL
LOCATION COORDINATES. FACILITIES TO BE LOCATED BY CLV SHALL INCLUDE AT A MINIMUM THE HORIZONTAL AND VERTICAL
(INVERT) LOCATION OF PUBLIC SEWER MANHOLES, STORM DRAIN MANHOLES AND TRANSITION STRUCTURES, STORM DRAIN
LATERALS AT THE CONNECTION TO THE STORM DRAIN MAIN AND AT THE CONNECTION TO A DROP INLET, THE CONNECTION OF
SEWER SERVICE LATERALS TO THE SEWER MAIN AND WHERE THE SEWER SERVICE LATERALS EXIT THE PUBLIC RIGHT-OF-WAY,
SEWER AND STORM DRAIN MAIN ALIGNMENT, INCLUDING DEFLECTION POINTS.

OR

(MAY BE USED ONLY ON PROJECTS ASSOCIATED WITH A TENATIVE MAP CONTAINING 5 LOTS OR MORE)

SANITARY SEWER AND STORM DRAIN FINAL LOCATION MAP(S) SHALL BE PROVIDED TO THE CITY AND APPROVED PRIOR TO
ACCEPTANCE OF FACILITY VIDEO INSPECTION. THE MAP(S) SHALL INCLUDE THE HORIZONTAL AND VERTICAL (INVERT) LOCATION OF
PUBLIC SEWER MANHOLES, STORM DRAIN MANHOLES AND TRANSITION STRUCTURES, STORM DRAIN LATERALS AT THE
CONNECTION TO THE STORM DRAIN MAIN AND AT THE CONNECTION TO A DROP INLET, THE CONNECTION OF SEWER SERVICE
LATERALS TO THE SEWER MAIN AND WHERE THE SEWER SERVICE LATERALS EXIT THE PUBLIC RIGHT-OF-WAY, SEWER AND STORM
DRAIN MAIN ALIGNMENT, INCLUDING DEFLECTION POINTS. THE LOCATION SHALL BE DESCRIBED BY COORDINATES WHICH SHALL BE
BASED ON THE OFFICIAL HORIZONTAL AND VERTICAL CONTROL NETWORKS OF THE CITY OF LAS VEGAS. FINAL LOCATION MAPS
MUST BE SEALED AND CERTIFIED BY A NEVADA PROFESSIONAL LAND SURVEYOR TO HAVE POSITIONAL CERTAINTIES OF ± 0.09
METERS (± 0.3 FEET) HORIZONTALLY AND VERTICALLY. A SEPARATE ELECTRONIC COMMA DELIMITED FILE FOR THE SANITARY
SEWER AND STORM DRAIN COORDINATES SHALL ALSO ACCOMPANY THE SANITARY SEWER AND STORM DRAIN FINAL LOCATION
MAP(S).

22. CCTV VIDEO INSPECTION IS REQUIRED FOR ALL SEWER AND STORM DRAINS. THE CCTV VIDEO INSPECTIONS NEED TO BE
PERFORMED PER THE DESIGN AND CONSTRUCTION STANDARDS FOR WASTEWATER COLLECTION SYSTEMS LATEST EDITION.


	Sheets and Views
	Model


